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Investors are in a jam. A troubled global economy, unpredictable markets, and a bewildering number of
investment choices create a dangerous landscape for individual and institutional investors alike. To meet this
challenge, most of us rely on a portfolio of fund managers to take risk on our behalves. Here, investment
expert Brian Portnoy delivers a powerful framework for choosing the right ones – and avoiding the losers.

Portnoy reveals that the right answers are found by confronting our own subconscious biases and behavioral
quirks. A paradox we all face is the natural desire for more choice in our lives, yet the more we have, the less
satisfied we become – whether we're at the grocery store, choosing doctors, or flipping through hundreds of
TV channels. So, too, with investing, where there are literally tens of thousands of funds from which to
choose. Hence "the investor's paradox": We crave abundant investment choices to conquer volatile markets,
yet with greater flexibility, the more overwhelmed and less empowered we become.

Leveraging the fresh insights of behavioral economics, Portnoy demystifies the opaque world of elite hedge
funds, addresses the limits of mass market mutual funds, and discards the false dichotomy between
"traditional" and "alternative" investments. He also explores why hedge funds have recently become such a
controversial and disruptive force. Turns out it's not the splashy headlines – spectacular trades, newly minted
billionaires, aggressive tactics – but something much more fundamental. The stratospheric rise to
prominence and availability of alternative strategies represents a further explosion in the size and complexity
of the choice set in a market already saturated with products. It constitutes something we all both crave and
detest.

The Investor's Paradox lights a path toward simplicity in a world of dangerous markets and overwhelming
choice. Written in accessible, jargon-free language, with a healthy skepticism of today's money management
industry, it offers not only practical tools for investment success but also a message of empowerment for
investors drowning in possibility.
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From reader reviews:

Steven Holt:

The book The Investor's Paradox: The Power of Simplicity in a World of Overwhelming Choice make one
feel enjoy for your spare time. You need to use to make your capable much more increase. Book can to get
your best friend when you getting strain or having big problem along with your subject. If you can make
looking at a book The Investor's Paradox: The Power of Simplicity in a World of Overwhelming Choice to
be your habit, you can get much more advantages, like add your own personal capable, increase your
knowledge about a number of or all subjects. You could know everything if you like wide open and read a
book The Investor's Paradox: The Power of Simplicity in a World of Overwhelming Choice. Kinds of book
are a lot of. It means that, science reserve or encyclopedia or some others. So , how do you think about this
publication?

Rose Warfield:

What do you think of book? It is just for students since they are still students or this for all people in the
world, the actual best subject for that? Simply you can be answered for that question above. Every person
has various personality and hobby for every single other. Don't to be obligated someone or something that
they don't wish do that. You must know how great as well as important the book The Investor's Paradox: The
Power of Simplicity in a World of Overwhelming Choice. All type of book is it possible to see on many
options. You can look for the internet options or other social media.

Marvis Byrnes:

In this period of time globalization it is important to someone to acquire information. The information will
make someone to understand the condition of the world. The healthiness of the world makes the information
much easier to share. You can find a lot of referrals to get information example: internet, classifieds, book,
and soon. You will see that now, a lot of publisher which print many kinds of book. Often the book that
recommended to you personally is The Investor's Paradox: The Power of Simplicity in a World of
Overwhelming Choice this guide consist a lot of the information of the condition of this world now. This
book was represented how does the world has grown up. The terminology styles that writer make usage of to
explain it is easy to understand. The writer made some research when he makes this book. That is why this
book ideal all of you.

Daniel Hanson:

Guide is one of source of expertise. We can add our expertise from it. Not only for students but native or
citizen have to have book to know the revise information of year to help year. As we know those ebooks
have many advantages. Beside many of us add our knowledge, may also bring us to around the world.
Through the book The Investor's Paradox: The Power of Simplicity in a World of Overwhelming Choice we
can take more advantage. Don't someone to be creative people? To become creative person must want to



read a book. Just choose the best book that acceptable with your aim. Don't possibly be doubt to change your
life at this book The Investor's Paradox: The Power of Simplicity in a World of Overwhelming Choice. You
can more attractive than now.
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