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"Chekhovian. . . . Every line of Fox's story, every gesture of her characters, is alive and
surprising."—Christopher Lehmann-Haupt, New York Times

On the eve of their trip to Africa, Laura Maldonada Clapper and her husband, Desmond, sit in a New York
City hotel room, drinking scotch-and-sodas and awaiting the arrival of three friends: Clara Hansen, Laura's
timid, brow-beaten daughter from a previous marriage; Carlos, Laura's flamboyant and charming brother;
and Peter Rice, a melancholy editor whom Laura hasn't seen for over a year. But what begins as a bon
voyage party soon parlays into a bitter, claustrophobic clash of family resentment. From the hotel room to
the tony restaurant to which the five embark, Laura presides over the escalating innuendo and hostility with
imperial cruelty, for she is hiding the knowledge that her mother, the family matriarch, has died of a heart
attack that morning. A novel as intense as it is unerringly observed, The Widow's Children is another
revelation of the storyteller's art from the incomparable Paula Fox.
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From reader reviews:

Matthew Coleman:

Have you spare time for any day? What do you do when you have more or little spare time? Yes, you can
choose the suitable activity regarding spend your time. Any person spent their very own spare time to take a
stroll, shopping, or went to often the Mall. How about open or even read a book called The Widow's
Children: A Novel? Maybe it is to be best activity for you. You recognize beside you can spend your time
with your favorite's book, you can wiser than before. Do you agree with its opinion or you have different
opinion?

Betty Benner:

The book The Widow's Children: A Novel gives you the sense of being enjoy for your spare time. You can
use to make your capable much more increase. Book can being your best friend when you getting pressure or
having big problem along with your subject. If you can make reading through a book The Widow's Children:
A Novel for being your habit, you can get far more advantages, like add your own personal capable, increase
your knowledge about a number of or all subjects. You are able to know everything if you like wide open
and read a guide The Widow's Children: A Novel. Kinds of book are several. It means that, science reserve
or encyclopedia or other people. So , how do you think about this publication?

Steven Ward:

The publication with title The Widow's Children: A Novel has a lot of information that you can discover it.
You can get a lot of gain after read this book. This book exist new knowledge the information that exist in
this guide represented the condition of the world now. That is important to yo7u to find out how the
improvement of the world. This specific book will bring you inside new era of the syndication. You can read
the e-book on the smart phone, so you can read the idea anywhere you want.

Edgar Hightower:

In this time globalization it is important to someone to acquire information. The information will make
professionals understand the condition of the world. The fitness of the world makes the information simpler
to share. You can find a lot of personal references to get information example: internet, newspaper, book,
and soon. You can view that now, a lot of publisher this print many kinds of book. The particular book that
recommended for your requirements is The Widow's Children: A Novel this book consist a lot of the
information in the condition of this world now. This kind of book was represented just how can the world
has grown up. The dialect styles that writer require to explain it is easy to understand. The actual writer made
some study when he makes this book. Honestly, that is why this book ideal all of you.
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