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Since his first road trip in 1956, driving from Oklahoma City to Los Angeles, Ed Ruscha has continued to
muse on America as seen from the road: "I like being in the car, and seeing things from that vantage point,"
he has said. "Sometimes I give myself assignments to go out on the road and explore different ideas. My
books are an example of that." Consisting of around 75 works spanning the artist's entire career, Ed Ruscha:
Road Tested includes many of the famous aforementioned artist's books, including Twenty-Six Gasoline
Stations, Real Estate Opportunities, Some Los Angeles Apartments, Thirty-Four Parking Lots and the
groundbreaking artist's book Every Building on the Sunset Strip; some of Ruscha's most iconic paintings,
such as the "Standard Stations" and the "Hollywood Signs," as well as paintings inspired by street names and
road signs; and his exploration of the topography of greater Los Angeles in paintings that depict aerial grids
of the city, as well as various southern California horizons and sunsets. Also examined here is the rarely seen
Ruscha film Miracle (1975), which tells the story of a mechanic whose obsessive repair of the carburetor on
a 1965 Mustang dooms his date with a beautiful woman. The first-ever treatment of a primary theme in the
artist's career, Road Tested at last gives Ed Ruscha his own road show.
Ed Ruscha (born 1937) has made pioneering work in the media of painting, printmaking, drawing,
bookmaking, photography and film since 1958. Associated in the early 1960s with the Ferus Gallery, Ruscha
was included in Walter Hopps' landmark Pop art show New Painting of Common Objects, at the Pasadena
Art Museum in 1962. His painting career was recently surveyed in Ed Ruscha: Fifty Years of Painting
(D.A.P., 2010).
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From reader reviews:

Ramiro Alvarez:

What do you think about book? It is just for students as they are still students or the idea for all people in the
world, the particular best subject for that? Just you can be answered for that question above. Every person
has distinct personality and hobby for every other. Don't to be compelled someone or something that they
don't would like do that. You must know how great along with important the book Ed Ruscha: Road Tested.
All type of book could you see on many methods. You can look for the internet solutions or other social
media.

Brian Rankins:

Do you have something that you like such as book? The e-book lovers usually prefer to opt for book like
comic, limited story and the biggest an example may be novel. Now, why not attempting Ed Ruscha: Road
Tested that give your entertainment preference will be satisfied simply by reading this book. Reading routine
all over the world can be said as the means for people to know world a great deal better then how they react
in the direction of the world. It can't be claimed constantly that reading practice only for the geeky man but
for all of you who wants to become success person. So , for all of you who want to start looking at as your
good habit, you may pick Ed Ruscha: Road Tested become your starter.

Irene Parker:

The book untitled Ed Ruscha: Road Tested contain a lot of information on that. The writer explains her idea
with easy way. The language is very clear to see all the people, so do not worry, you can easy to read this.
The book was authored by famous author. The author brings you in the new period of literary works. It is
easy to read this book because you can read more your smart phone, or program, so you can read the book
with anywhere and anytime. In a situation you wish to purchase the e-book, you can open their official web-
site and also order it. Have a nice learn.

Samantha Smith:

Some individuals said that they feel bored stiff when they reading a book. They are directly felt the item
when they get a half parts of the book. You can choose often the book Ed Ruscha: Road Tested to make your
own reading is interesting. Your own skill of reading talent is developing when you including reading. Try to
choose straightforward book to make you enjoy you just read it and mingle the opinion about book and
reading especially. It is to be very first opinion for you to like to available a book and examine it. Beside that
the e-book Ed Ruscha: Road Tested can to be a newly purchased friend when you're sense alone and confuse
in doing what must you're doing of that time.
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