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"I am strong, and my flash is bright, And I will defend you and make things all right." These are the magic
words to call upon Manner-Man - a superhero who can help control bullies and teach children ways to be
considerate of others. Manner-Man arrives, shouting "To the Rescue", helping children learn about sharing
and warning about not 'hitting with words.' He teaches that if someone starts pushing, just shout out "not
nice!" Meet the children who form the Manner-Man team and find out how to join! Manner-Man
incorporates messages and characters found within some of Cannon's earlier books - helping children learn
how to cope with bullies and look within themselves for their inner superhero! This is the fifth rhyming
children's book by this award-winning author whose other bestselling books include Gimme-Jimmy, The
Magic Word, Peter and the Whimper-Whineys and Santa's Birthday Gift. Former teacher Sherrill S. Cannon
has won a dozen awards for her four previous rhyming books and is also the author of six published and
internationally performed plays for elementary school children. She has been called "a modern day Dr.Seuss"
- GMTA Review. Publisher's website: http://sbpra.com/SherrillSCannon
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From reader reviews:

Jeffrey David:

Do you have favorite book? If you have, what is your favorite's book? Book is very important thing for us to
learn everything in the world. Each publication has different aim or goal; it means that e-book has different
type. Some people sense enjoy to spend their time for you to read a book. They are really reading whatever
they take because their hobby is actually reading a book. Think about the person who don't like examining a
book? Sometime, particular person feel need book whenever they found difficult problem or even exercise.
Well, probably you'll have this Manner-Man.

Joan Freeman:

This book untitled Manner-Man to be one of several books that best seller in this year, that's because when
you read this guide you can get a lot of benefit into it. You will easily to buy this kind of book in the book
shop or you can order it via online. The publisher of this book sells the e-book too. It makes you quickly to
read this book, as you can read this book in your Smart phone. So there is no reason for you to past this
publication from your list.

Flora Gordon:

A lot of people always spent their very own free time to vacation or maybe go to the outside with them loved
ones or their friend. Do you realize? Many a lot of people spent these people free time just watching TV, or
playing video games all day long. In order to try to find a new activity this is look different you can read a
new book. It is really fun to suit your needs. If you enjoy the book that you read you can spent the entire day
to reading a guide. The book Manner-Man it doesn't matter what good to read. There are a lot of people that
recommended this book. These were enjoying reading this book. When you did not have enough space to
develop this book you can buy often the e-book. You can m0ore simply to read this book from a smart
phone. The price is not to fund but this book provides high quality.

Rex Vogler:

You could spend your free time to learn this book this reserve. This Manner-Man is simple to create you can
read it in the park your car, in the beach, train and also soon. If you did not possess much space to bring
typically the printed book, you can buy often the e-book. It is make you easier to read it. You can save often
the book in your smart phone. Consequently there are a lot of benefits that you will get when one buys this
book.
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