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What follows is not a translation in the ordinary sense of the word. It’s more like a paraphrase. Rather than
worry over the letter of the text, the goal has been to illuminate the large scale patterns that structure it. The
King James Version, for instance, renders Paul’s letter with uncanny beauty but is opaque as an argument.
Modern translations tend to have the same problem. Their overriding concern is with the letter of the text,
not with its logic. As a result, Paul’s forest is always getting sacrificed for the sake of his trees. But Paul’s
work is too important, his good news too urgent, to leave so much of him locked in the first century. We
need our renderings to do more than mimic the original, we need them to bleed and breathe. This work
argues that the deep logic of Romans comes into sharp focus around a single premise: Paul’s claim that grace
is not God’s backup plan. Paul never quite puts it like this, but he implies it at every turn.
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From reader reviews:

Kirsten Muncy:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray an individual, why because this Grace Is Not God's Backup Plan:
An Urgent Paraphrase of Paul's Letter to the Romans book written by well-known writer whose to say well
how to make book which can be understand by anyone who have read the book. Written with good manner
for you, leaking every ideas and writing skill only for eliminate your own hunger then you still hesitation
Grace Is Not God's Backup Plan: An Urgent Paraphrase of Paul's Letter to the Romans as good book not
simply by the cover but also by content. This is one publication that can break don't ascertain book by its
handle, so do you still needing yet another sixth sense to pick this kind of!? Oh come on your reading sixth
sense already told you so why you have to listening to yet another sixth sense.

Judith Bryant:

Are you kind of busy person, only have 10 or 15 minute in your time to upgrading your mind talent or
thinking skill actually analytical thinking? Then you are receiving problem with the book compared to can
satisfy your small amount of time to read it because pretty much everything time you only find e-book that
need more time to be go through. Grace Is Not God's Backup Plan: An Urgent Paraphrase of Paul's Letter to
the Romans can be your answer because it can be read by you who have those short spare time problems.

Lena Robertson:

As we know that book is vital thing to add our understanding for everything. By a reserve we can know
everything you want. A book is a group of written, printed, illustrated or maybe blank sheet. Every year
ended up being exactly added. This guide Grace Is Not God's Backup Plan: An Urgent Paraphrase of Paul's
Letter to the Romans was filled in relation to science. Spend your extra time to add your knowledge about
your scientific research competence. Some people has distinct feel when they reading a book. If you know
how big selling point of a book, you can feel enjoy to read a guide. In the modern era like currently, many
ways to get book that you wanted.

Louella Rape:

E-book is one of source of information. We can add our understanding from it. Not only for students and also
native or citizen will need book to know the upgrade information of year to help year. As we know those
publications have many advantages. Beside many of us add our knowledge, can also bring us to around the
world. By book Grace Is Not God's Backup Plan: An Urgent Paraphrase of Paul's Letter to the Romans we
can acquire more advantage. Don't you to definitely be creative people? To get creative person must prefer to
read a book. Only choose the best book that acceptable with your aim. Don't become doubt to change your
life with that book Grace Is Not God's Backup Plan: An Urgent Paraphrase of Paul's Letter to the Romans.
You can more pleasing than now.
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