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A long-overdue reissue of this debut novel from a comedy legend. Mr Lonely follows the exploits of a lowly
two-bit comedian, Sid Lewis, through his strange and eventful life. Sid plays dingy smoke-filled clubs,
earning next to nothing and chasing after the dancing girls. He meets the woman of his dreams and ties the
knot - but still has an eye for the ladies. One night, in front of a particularly rough crowd, he tries out a new
character...and Mr Lonely is born. The act is seen by someone from the BBC who offers Sid the chance to
perform on television. He becomes an overnight success, quickly taking to a new life of champagne and
stardom - and continues to chase anything in a skirt. But great comedy is often laced with tragedy and Sid's
life is no exception as his excesses and philandering threaten to catch up with him. Mr Lonely was Eric's first
novel, written while he was recovering from his second heart attack and contemplating a career away from
the stage. It has all the hallmarks of his legendary comic talent and is being brought back into print for the
first time in nearly thirty years.
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From reader reviews:

Eric Butler:

With other case, little men and women like to read book Mr. Lonely. You can choose the best book if you
love reading a book. As long as we know about how is important some sort of book Mr. Lonely. You can
add expertise and of course you can around the world by just a book. Absolutely right, due to the fact from
book you can learn everything! From your country until eventually foreign or abroad you will find yourself
known. About simple issue until wonderful thing you can know that. In this era, we can open a book or
perhaps searching by internet system. It is called e-book. You can utilize it when you feel fed up to go to the
library. Let's go through.

Doris Trumbull:

As people who live in the actual modest era should be update about what going on or data even knowledge to
make these keep up with the era which can be always change and move ahead. Some of you maybe will
update themselves by studying books. It is a good choice to suit your needs but the problems coming to you
actually is you don't know what kind you should start with. This Mr. Lonely is our recommendation so you
keep up with the world. Why, because this book serves what you want and wish in this era.

Bonnie Vassallo:

People live in this new day of lifestyle always aim to and must have the free time or they will get lots of
stress from both way of life and work. So , when we ask do people have time, we will say absolutely of
course. People is human not really a huge robot. Then we consult again, what kind of activity do you possess
when the spare time coming to a person of course your answer can unlimited right. Then do you try this one,
reading ebooks. It can be your alternative inside spending your spare time, often the book you have read is
actually Mr. Lonely.

Ian Bracy:

You can obtain this Mr. Lonely by look at the bookstore or Mall. Simply viewing or reviewing it may to be
your solve issue if you get difficulties for the knowledge. Kinds of this publication are various. Not only
simply by written or printed but additionally can you enjoy this book through e-book. In the modern era just
like now, you just looking by your local mobile phone and searching what your problem. Right now, choose
your current ways to get more information about your reserve. It is most important to arrange you to
ultimately make your knowledge are still upgrade. Let's try to choose right ways for you.
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